

72-2021-31

1-KLS martin

20200371	10			FASCIOMAXILLARY							
20200371	20	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-DE00-001	DE	90189084	1023	PC		
20200371	30	10	22-527-05-05	Bone wire soft Ø 0.5 mm, 10 meters	FSM-DE00-002	DE	90211090	1016	PC	15,56	15.808,96
20200371	40	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-DE00-003	DE	90189084	480	PC		
20200371	50	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-DE17-007	DE	90189084	341	PC		
20200371	60	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID		DE	90189084	68	PC		
20200371	70	10	20-642-16-07	TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, MAYO-HEGAR, 16 CM	FSM-HE00-001	MY	90189084	424	PC	72,60	30.782,40
20200371	80	10	22-500-11-07	TC-WIRE TWISTING FORCEPS, 15.5 CM	FSM-HE00-002	MY	90189084	315	PC	100,48	31.651,20
20200371	90	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-HE00-003	DE	90189084	257	PC		
20200371	100	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-HE00-004	DE	90189084	174	PC		
20200371	110	10	23-304-10-07	BONE CURETTE, VOLKM., OVAL, NO. 0, 17 CM	FSM-HE00-005	DE	90189084	211	PC	50,98	10.756,78
20200371	120	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-HE00-006	DE	90189084	184	PC		
20200371	130	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-HE00-008	DE	90189084	177	PC		
20200371	140	10	12-170-15-07	DRESSING FORCEPS, MCINDOE, 15 CM	FSM-HE00-009	MY	90189084	240	PC	30,13	7.231,20
20200371	150	10	12-370-15-07	Diss. forceps, Gillies, 1x2 T., 15,5 cm	FSM-HE00-010	DE	90189084	283	PC	26,29	7.440,07
20200371	160	10	11-280-18-07	Scissors, diss.,Metzenb.,bl/bl,str.,18cm	FSM-HE00-011	DE	90189084	456	PC	35,15	16.028,40
20200371	170	10	11-285-18-07	DISSECTING SCISSORS, CVD., 18 CM		DE	90189084	456	PC	37,53	17.113,68
20200371	180	10	11-226-16-07	SCISSORS, KELLY, STR., 16 CM	FSM-HE00-012	DE	90189084	416	PC	42,18	17.546,88
20200371	190	10	11-710-15-07	MICRO SCISS., SH/SH, STR., 15 CM	FSM-HE00-013	DE	90189084	198	PC	208,85	41.352,30
20200371	200	10	38-140-13-07	MOUTH GAG, HEISTER, 13 CM	FSM-HE00-014	DE	90189084	196	PC	89,55	17.551,80
20200371	210	10	38-161-14-07	MOUTH GAG, MOLT, F. ADULTS, 13 CM		DE	90189084	196	PC	246,93	48.398,28

OFFER	POS	UPOS	ARTNO	DESCRIPTION	ITEM	COUNTRY OF ORIGIN	HS CODE	QTY.	UNIT	PRICE / ITEM USD	TOTAL / PRICE USD
20200371	220	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID		DE	90189084	196	PC		
20200371	230	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-HE00-015	DE	90189084	257	PC		
20200371	240	10	38-452-17-07	TONGUE HOLD. FORCEPS, COLLIN, FEN., 17CM	FSM-HE00-016	DE	90189084	201	PC	86,44	17.374,44
20200371	250	10	48-111-22-07	ALVEOLAR-RETRACTOR, OBWEGESER, 24 CM	FSM-HE00-017	DE	90189084	198	PC	177,49	35.143,02
20200371	260	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-HE00-018	DE	90189084	148	PC		
20200371	270	10	48-735-19-07	MIDLINE FLAP RETRACTOR ACC. ARNETT	FSM-HE00-019	DE	90189084	191	PC	173,01	33.044,91
20200371	280	10	38-701-67-07	Zygoma Elevator, Rowe, 26 cm	FSM-HE00-020	DE	90189084	97	PC	875,31	84.905,07
20200371	290	10	38-701-01-07	REPOSITION FORCEPS, ROWE, R., 21.5 CM	FSM-HE00-021	DE	90189084	86	PC	352,89	30.348,54
20200371	300	10	38-700-01-07	REPOSITION FORCEPS, ROWE, L., 21.5 CM		DE	90189084	86	PC	352,89	30.348,54
20200371	310	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-HE00-022	DE	90189084	75	PC		
20200371	320	10	37-327-19-07	SEPTUM FCPS., MIDDLETON, CLOSED, 20 CM	FSM-HE00-023	DE	90189084	81	PC	489,05	39.613,05
20200371	330	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-HE00-024	DE	90189084	111	PC		
20200371	340	10	48-175-17-07	MANDIBULA-AWL, OBWEGESER, 17.5 CM	FSM-HE00-025	DE	90189084	97	PC	94,30	9.147,10
20200371	350	10	99-999-99-99	NO BID	FSM-HE00-026	DE	90189084	863	PC		
20200371	360	10	17-412-15-07	Ruler, mm/inch, 15 cm	FSM-HE00-027	DE	90189084	236	PC	2,78	656,08
										TOTAL:	542.242,70 USD